
FAYE KNIGHT

Faye Knight is a contemporary 
acrylics and mixed media 
artist. Established on the 
Oxfordshire and West 
Berkshire art scene. Her

vibrant, impressionist studies 
of the English countryside now 
sell worldwide.

Her cottage studio is situated 
off the beaten track, amongst 
rolling farmland and winding 
wooded paths, each season 
provides an endless variety of 
textures and hues to be 
captured in her paintings.

If a running theme could be 
suggested for Faye’s work, 
‘Be in touch with nature’ would 
summarise it very well. With 
names including: ‘The Quiet 
Place’, ‘Into the Woods’, ‘The 
Warm Scent of Summer’ and 
‘Joy’, each painting speaks of 
the release found in 
abandoning our senses to the 
timeless, intoxicating beauty of 
the hidden places in 
ournatural world.

Faye is an accredited member 
of West Berkshire and North 
Hampshire Open Studios and 
a member of West Ox Arts 
Gallery. You can also see

selected works exhibited at 
Oxford Art Weeks during May, 
the Artysan Gallery in Stow-
on-the-Wold,

Howarth’s Gallery Newbury 
and at her Open Studios 
during May.

Faye Knight
mobile:  07541 856796

email:  mrsfayeknight@hotmail.com

website:  fayeknight.art

instagram:  knightfaye

website
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